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Prophetic History Timeline Part 1 of 2 

 
1980 - 
Community Bible Church Established  
 
1990 - 
Alan DeBoer installed as Lead Pastor 
 
“Vision of Nations” I had a vision that Pagosa Springs was a front porch with 
young people of all ages running in and out the front door.  They all were dressed 
in primary colors, so bright and clear.  The Lord confirmed revealed that He was 
going to send the nations to Pagosa Springs and the primary colors represented 
the flags of the nations. 
 
1992 - 
A friend of a member of the church family went to Israel and was told by many 
prophetic people there (mostly Messianic Jews) that they had been receiving 
words, dreams, and visions from the Lord regarding “escape routes” around the 
world.  She saw some of these maps of routes that had been drawn up.  She 
said before this she had never heard of Pagosa Springs, but on one of the maps 
she saw the name.  There is coming a time a great upheaval in this nation and 
around the world and many will seek refuge in “cities of refuge” established by 
the Lord to protect his people.  She told me there would be children, young 
people, Jews, and peoples from every nation taking refuge in cities set apart by 
God.  Pagosa Springs will be one of those cities. (Exodus Story Ex. 19:4, Rev. 
12:6,14) 
 
1994 - 
Pastor Al encounters the ministry and of the gifts of the Holy Spirit  
 
CBC begins to embrace ministry gifts encounters with the Holy Spirit 
 
1995  
“Vision of River” Pastor Al was leading the church into a turbulent “forerunner” 
river. The river was stripping away all worldly mindsets and shaking all things not 
built on the rock of Christ.  Pastor Al was in the river to his waist but many people 
who were following him were afraid to enter and would only go in ankle deep. 
Soon other people begin to go deeper into the forerunner river. As we entered 
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the deep together everything the river touched turned from brown and dead to 
green and full of life. (Eze. 47:1-12) 
  
1998  
CBC leadership begins to be trained in healing and deliverance (Luke 4:18-19) 
 
2000  
CBC attends cleansing streams regional conference in Colorado Springs 
 
2001  
Virginia Humphrys (Children's Director) attends a IHOP-KC Children's pastors 
conference.  
 
Jelly Beans and Squiggly things fun club started as an outreach to the public 
school children at the Elementary school.   
 
2002 
Restoration folks and their children attend the first Signs and Wonders camp at 
IHOP-KC 
 
Virginia H. and Tammy S. start an after school kids praise band with bible study 
and ministry.  They teach kids to sing, play an instrument, and encounter God. 
This continues till 2008 
 
2003  
We host the first regional S&W camp held here and has been held every year 
since. 
 
2004 - 
Name changed to Restoration Fellowship (All that was lost, neglected, forgotten, 
or stolen) 
 
First Cleansing Streams retreat, Al’s counseling drops 70% 
 
Really strong sense to pray for the “Peace of Jerusalem” and we displayed the 
Palestinian and Israeli flag next to each other as a prophetic symbol of the 
promise of God.  Isaac and Ishmael word (Gen. 16:11-12, Is. 19:23-25) 
 
Intentional focus on prayer and worship 
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Prophetic Word “In the coming days, God will confide in us more and more of His 
plans for Restoration Fellowship and all the churches and people of God in 
Pagosa Springs.  He will restore and reconcile (Forerunner Spirit) and we will see 
the spirit of division fall and the Spirit of God and His Unity and Oneness come 
about.  I could hear rain falling.  I turned and looked the other direction to see the 
rain, but I was only hearing it in my mind.  The Lord said to me, “I will bring the 
nations to Pagosa.” (Mal. 4:5-6) 
 
 
2007  
 
Prophetic Word “The Lord desires Pagosa Springs to be a “Watering Hole to the 
Nations” You are sending people to the Nations and I will send the Nations to you 
if you enter into the deep waters of the (River of life).  I am calling to to jump into 
the waters of aggressive intercession, evangelism, and spiritual warfare outside 
of your four church building walls.  To enter the river you must live a set apart life 
(Forerunner), ask me for deep intimacy, a greater measure of my Spirit, and 
strive to enter my rest and then I will send the Nations to Pagosa, and they will 
take back what they receive from you to the Nations they are from.  I will make 
you a true watering hole to the nations. (Mat. 11:28) 
 
Regional cleansing streams influence 
 
2008  
 
Friday night prayer meetings start with mostly young people.  This eventually is 
called “Healing waters house of prayer” 
 
Cleansing Streams Ministry to the nations through the Quiller’s 
 
2009 Prophetic Word - “Vision of Angel Army” God has anointed the RF 
(Restoration Fellowship) to be the hub over this city and entire area between the 
San Luis Valley and Cortez, etc. I told them God had placed them to be a "safe 
place," a "place of refuge," and as an "underground railroad" depot or weigh 
station. I felt the Lord stress how important it is to prepare for tough times ahead. 
I believe that the Lord would raise R.F. up as forerunners, a strong and fervent 
Zionist friend of Israel and Jews to help lead the church in their city into its 
destiny. 
 
 
 


